
Vendor:

ITEM # QTY. UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE 

1 Each School Bus, Small Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 14 + Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 041 $50,013.00 $50,013.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $2,951.00 $2,951.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $5,813.00 $5,813.00

$58,777.00

1 Each School Bus, Small Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 14 + Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

1 Each School Bus, Medium Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 18-25 + Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 041 $50,199.00 $50,199.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $2,951.00 $2,951.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $5,813.00 $5,813.00

$58,963.00

1 Each School Bus, Medium Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 18-25 + Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

Type A School & Activity Bus Worksheet

Carolina Thomas, LLC   (Discount already applied to Items 1-13 and reflected in UNIT PRICE. 3% MSRP Discount applies to Optional Equipment Offerings as indicate on that spreadsheet.) 
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Item 1 Total:
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Item 2 Total:
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Item 3 Total:

4

Item 4 Total:



1 Each School Bus, Large Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 26-30 + Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 051 $51,962.00 $51,962.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $1,188.00 $1,188.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $5,064.00 $5,064.00

$58,214.00

1 Each School Bus, Large Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 26-30 + Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

28 Each Activity Bus, Small Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 14+ Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 041 $48,452.00 $1,356,656.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $2,951.00 $2,951.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $5,813.00 $5,813.00

$1,365,420.00

28 Each Activity Bus, Small Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 14+ Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

1 Each Activity Bus, Medium Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 18-25 + Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 041 $48,708.00 $48,708.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $2,951.00 $2,951.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $5,813.00 $5,813.00

$57,472.00

Item 5 Total:
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Item 6 Total:
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Item 7 Total:
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Item 8 Total:
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Item 9 Total:



1 Each Activity Bus, Medium Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 18-25 + Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

1 Each Activity Bus, Large Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 26-30 + Driver             Thomas Built Buses Minotour 051 $50,471.00 $50,471.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century NCL919FIB-2 $1,188.00 $1,188.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor Braun Century NCL919FIB-2 $4,050.00 $4,050.00

$55,709.00

1 Each Activity Bus, Large Configuration, Diesel Engine, Passengers Max 26-30 + Driver             No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

1 Each Add Lift & Flat Floor No Bid No Bid 0 $0.00

$0.00

$1,654,555.00

ITEM # QTY. UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE 

3 Each Activity Bus, Small Configuration, Gasoline Engine, Passengers Max 14 + Driver     DHHS 
ONLY        Thomas Built Buses Minotour 041 $51,644.00 $154,932.00

1 Each Add Lift Braun Century Minotour 051  
NCL919FIB-2 $3,208.00 $3,208.00

$158,140.00

$1,812,695.00

Item 11 Total:
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Grand Total (Items 1-13):
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Item 12 Total:

 Grand Total (Items 1-12) :

DHHS Only
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